
REF, Rec’d Date, Parish 
and Wards  

 
23/24 

Applicant Agent 

    

WA/2023/01271 
 
2023-06-07 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh East 
 

Erection of extensions and alterations to 
existing veterinary clinic to provide one 
dwelling and a Class E commercial unit 
with associated works. 
 
YEW TREE COTTAGE, HORSHAM 
ROAD, CRANLEIGH, GU6 8DP 

39 HIGH STREET 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8AS 

PO BOX 1014 
RH12 9TJ 

TM/2023/01312 
 
2023-06-09 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh West 
 

APPLICATION FOR REMOVAL OF TREE 
SUBJECT OF TREE PRESERVATION 
ORDER WA175 
 
51 HEWITTS ROAD, CRANLEIGH, GU6 
8US 

51 HEWITTS 
ROAD 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8US 

BUTLERS 
COTTAGE 
TOWER HILL 
HORSHAM 
RH13 0AQ 

TM/2023/01255 
 
2023-06-05 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh West 
 

APPLICATION FOR WORKS TO TREES 
SUBJECT OF TREE PRESERVATION 
ORDER 26/99 
 
16 NIGHTINGALES, CRANLEIGH, GU6 
8DE 

16 NIGHTINGALES 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8DE 

 

WA/2023/01299 
 
2023-06-09 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh West 
 

Alterations to elevations and fenestration. 
 
EXETER HOUSE, TYLERS COURT, 
CRANLEIGH 

200 DUKES RIDE 
CROWTHORNE 
RG45 6DS 

200 DUKES RIDE 
CROWTHORNE 
RG45 6DS 

TM/2023/01257 
 
2023-06-06 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh East 
 

APPLICATION FOR WORKS TO TREE 
SUBJECT OF TREE PRESERVATION 
ORDER 39/99 
 
13 HOMEWOOD, CRANLEIGH, GU6 7HS 

13 HOMEWOOD 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 7HS 

HESTERS YARD 
OAK HILL 
WOOD STREET 
VILLAGE 
GUILDFORD 
GU3 3ET 

WA/2023/01301 
 
2023-06-09 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh East 
 

Certificate of Lawfulness under Section 
192 for extension of existing rear dormer. 
 
9 HARRIER CLOSE, CRANLEIGH, GU6 
7BS 

9 HARRIER 
CLOSE 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 7BS 

GARDEN COTTAGE 
70 HIGH STREET 
HASLEMERE 
GU27 2LA 

WA/2023/01294 
 
2023-06-08 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh West 
 

Listed building consent for installation of 
replacement windows and roof slates. 
 
OLIVERS HOUSE, 97 HIGH STREET, 
CRANLEIGH, GU6 8AU 

AMLETS HILL 
AMLETS LANE 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 7DH 

UNIT A5 
NEW BARN FARM  
COMMON ROAD 
FUNTINGTON 
PO18 9DA 



WA/2023/01292 
 
2023-06-08 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh East 
 

Erection of 2 entrance gates to existing 
vehicular accesses. 
 
CORNWALL HOUSE, BRIDGE ROAD, 
CRANLEIGH, GU6 7HH 

CORNWALL 
HOUSE 
BRIDGE ROAD 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 7HH 

1 ABINGER CLOSE 
NORTH 
HOLMWOOD 
RH5 4TB 

 

  



REF, Rec’d Date, Parish 
and Wards  

 
23/25 

Applicant Agent 

    

WA/2023/01329 
 
2023-06-15 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh West 
 

Certificate of Lawfulness under Section 
192 for erection of a single storey rear 
extension. 
 
78 LONGHURST AVENUE, CRANLEIGH, 
GU6 8FG 

78 LONGHURST 
AVENUE 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8FG 

6 WELLWYNDS 
ROAD 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8BP 

WA/2023/01338 
 
2023-06-15 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh East 
 

Erection of extensions and alterations 
following demolition of existing extensions. 
 
WOODSIDE, NEW PARK ROAD, 
CRANLEIGH, GU6 7HJ 

WOODSIDE 
NEW PARK ROAD 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 7HJ 

KENT HOUSE 
81 HIGH STREET 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8AU 

TM/2023/01318 
 
2023-06-12 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh West 
 

APPLICATION FOR REMOVAL OF TREE 
SUBJECT OF TREE PRESERVATION 
ORDER WA175 
 
53 HEWITTS ROAD, CRANLEIGH, GU6 
8US 

53 HEWITTS 
ROAD 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8US 

3 OVERFORD 
DRIVE 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8BJ 

 

  



REF, Rec’d Date, Parish 
and Wards  

 
23/26 

Applicant Agent 

    

TM/2023/01384 
 
2023-06-21 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh East 
 

APPLICATION FOR WORKS TO TREE 
SUBJECT OF TREE PRESERVATION 
ORDER 03/19 
 
CROFTON, THE RIDGEWAY, 
CRANLEIGH, GU6 7HW 

CROFTON 
THE RIDGEWAY 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 7HW 

8 NUGENT CLOSE 
DUNSFOLD 
GODALMING 
GU8 4NW 

WA/2023/01420 
 
2023-06-26 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh West 
 

Erection of bay window and alterations to 
elevations. 
 
STRATHAVON, GUILDFORD ROAD, 
CRANLEIGH, GU6 8PR 

STRATHAVON 
GUILDFORD 
ROAD 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8PR 

ASTRA HOUSE 
ASTRA WORKS  
THE COMMON 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8RZ 

WA/2023/01417 
 
2023-06-26 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh East 
 

Erection of extensions and alterations 
together with alterations to attached 
garage to provide annexe accommodation. 
 
CRANBORNE, AVENUE ROAD, 
CRANLEIGH, GU6 7LL 

CRANBORNE 
AVENUE ROAD 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 7LL 

SAWYERS 
PEASLAKE LANE 
PEASLAKE 
GU5 9RL 

PRA/2023/01392 
 
2023-06-26 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh West 
 

Erection of a single storey rear extension 
which would extend 8m beyond the rear 
wall of the original house for which the 
height would be 3.65 m and for which the 
height of the eaves would be 3.65 m. 
 
BROOKLANDS, UPFOLD LANE, 
CRANLEIGH, GU6 8PD 
 

BROOKLANDS 
UPFOLD LANE 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8PD 

18 SAWMILL 
CLOSE 
TOTNES 
TQ9 5WT 

WA/2023/01415 
 
2023-06-26 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh West 
 

Erection of extensions and alterations 
together with alterations to garage to 
provide habitable accommodation. 
 
9 WYNDHAM CRESCENT, CRANLEIGH, 
GU6 8UQ 

9 WYNDHAM 
CRESCENT 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8UQ 

ALAN SHARP 
ASSOCIATES 
THURSLEY HOUSE  
53 STATION ROAD 
SHALFORD 
GU4 8HA 

WA/2023/01406 
 
2023-06-26 
 
P: Cranleigh CP 
 
W: Cranleigh East 
 

Certificate of Lawfulness under Section 
192 for the erection of a single storey side 
extension and installation of a window to 
existing side elevation following demolition 
of detached garage. 
 
MOSSY COPSE, SMITHWOOD 
COMMON, CRANLEIGH, GU6 8QR 
 

MOSSY COPSE 
SMITHWOOD 
COMMON 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8QR 

MOSSY COPSE 
SMITHWOOD 
COMMON 
CRANLEIGH 
GU6 8QR 

 

 


